Jackson Hole Fire/EMS

Operations Manual

Developed by: W‘W( W Title: Codes and Amendments

Kathy Clay, Fitd Marshal Division: 12
Article: 1

Approved by: M‘*‘é‘*ﬁ ~— Revised: 05/01/2022

Brady Hanben, Chief Pages: 12

PURPOSE

The purpose of this policy is to indicate the Codes and Amendments adopted by the Town of Jackson
and Teton County. Adoption as listed herein is dated January 1, 2022 for the Town of Jackson and May
1, 2022 for Teton County.

SECTION | — GENERAL PROVISIONS

1.
2.

Title, This resolution shall be known as the Fire Code Resolution of Teton County, Wyoming.
Authority. The Fire Code Resolution of Teton County is authorized by Sections 35-9-101 through
35-9-130, as amended and 18-5-201 through 18-5-207, W.S., {1977}, as amended.

Purpose. This chapter is enacted to provide for the enforcement of the Teton County
Comprehensive Master Plan and implementing resolutions and minimum requirements to
safeguard life or limb, health, and the public safety and welfare and the protection of property
by regulating and controlling the construction, alteration, removal, demolition, equipment,
materials, maintenance, use and occupancy of all building and premises within the
unincorporated portions of Teton County.

Jurisdiction. The territorial jurisdiction of this chapter shall include all of the unincorporated
lands within Teton County.

Interpretation. In their interpretation and application, the provisions of this resolution shall be
held to be minimum requirements. No provision of this resolution is intended to repeal,
abrogate, annul, impair or interfere with any existing resclution of the County, except as is
specifically repealed by adoption of this resolution, provided that where any provision of this
resolution imposes more stringent regulations, requirements, or limitations than are imposed by
any other resolution of Teton County, or any statute of the State of Wyoming, or regulation of
any of its departments, then the provisions of this resolution all govern.

Adoption of Codes. In order to carry out the purposes set forth above, the following codes and
documents, (except for portions thereof specifically excluded by the County Commissioners
from time to time) are hereby adopted:




7. Fire Code Official. The “Fire Code Official” referred to by the International Fire Code, as herein
adopted, is the officer charged with the implementation, administration and enforcement of
such codes. The Fire Code Official is hereby defined and declared to be the Fire Marshal of the
Jackson Hole Fire/EMS, as appointed by the Chief of the Jackson Hole Fire/EMS.

8. Enforcement. It shall be the duty of the Fire Marshal to enforce the provisions of the resolution
and to make inspections and tests hereunder.

SECTION Il - THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE (IFC)

The International Fire Code (IFC), 2021 Edition, including Appendices B, C, D, E, F, and G and utilizing the
most current suggested standards where such standards are referenced in the code, as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., has been locally adopted by the Town of Jackson and Teton County,
with the following amendments:

1. GENERAL: Substitute the National Electrical Code for all reference to the ICC Electrical Code
throughout the IFC.
2. CHAPTER 3, General Precautions Against Fire, Section 307, Open Burning. Add sections:

307.6 Pile Volume. The pile volume of any open burn shail not exceed 1000 cubic feet.
307.7 Prohibited materials. Materials containing paints, resins, glues, stains or any
other manufactured coating or bonding material shall not be burned.

307.8 Completed burn. All burning must be completed and suppressed by nightfall.
307.9 Reporting burns. All property owners, irrelevant of property acreage size, must
report open burning activity to Teton County Sheriff Dispatch.

3. CHAPTER 4, Emergency Planning and Preparedness, SECTION 408, Use and Occupancy-
Related Requirements, SUBSECTIONS 403.4 Group E Occupancies. Add section:

403.4.4 Alternate type of drill. Alternate safety drills may be used in lieu of fire
evacuation drills provided fire evacuation drills are conducted at each public or private
Groupe E Occupancy not less than four (4) times during any one (1) academic year. The
building’s fire alarm system shall be tested at each fire evacuation or alternate safety
drill. An alternate safety drill may include any organized response to a potential threat
to the health and safety of the student population.

4, CHAPTER 5, Fire Service Features, SECTION 507, Fire Protection Water Supplies, add
subsection:

507.2.3 Open water ponds. Open water ponds are not permitted for fire department
water supplies.

5. CHAPTER 5, Fire Service Features, SECTION 507, Fire Protection Water Supplies,
SUBSCECTION 507.5.1 Where Required. Amend exceptions to read:

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirements shatl be 500
feet (152m).



2. For building equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2, the distance
requirement shall be 500 feet (152m).

6. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems, SECTION 903, Automatic Sprinkler
Systems, SUBSECTION 903.3 Installation requirements, Add exception:

3. 903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations The upper lid of an elevator shaft built in accordance
with Section 3008 of the International Building Code.

7. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 903, Automatic Sprinkler Systems,
SUBSECTION 903.2 Where Required. Add second paragraph and exception:

Additionally, all structures, regardless of occupancy, 5000 square feet or larger shall be
protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system, installed in accordance with
further requirements of this Chapter whichever applies based on type of occupancy.
Where requirements in this chapter are more restrictive, the more restrictive
requirement shall control. For the purpose of Section 903, area separation walls shall
not define separate buildings.

Exception: Agricultural buildings.

Where non-agricultural uses, other than residential, occur within an agricultural
building, and comprise not more than 10% of the floor area of such building, an
automatic fire-extinguishing system may be omitted unless otherwise required by this
Chapter.

8. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 907, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems,
SUBSECTION 907.2.1 Group A. Delete exception.

9. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 907, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems,
SUBSECTION 907.2.2 Group B. Delete exception.

10. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 907, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems,
SUBSECTION 907.2.4 Group F. Delete exception.

11. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 907, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems,
SUBSECTION 907.2.7 Group M. Delete exception.

12. CHAPTER 9, Fire Protection Systems, SECTION 913, Fire Pumps, SUBSECTION 913.2
Protection against interruption of service. Add subsections:

913.2.1 Service disconnect. Fire pump service wiring shall be installed such that
disconnecting the normal building service does not interrupt power to the fire pump.
A separate means of disconnect shall be provided for the fire pump and installed
such that its power supply is taken from the line side of the building’s service panel.
The service disconnect shall be installed in accordance with Section 695.6 of the
National Electrical Code.



913.2.2 Protection of service wiring. Service wiring to fire pumps shall be within 2-
hour fire-resistant construction. Installation shall be in accordance with Section
695.1 of the National Electrical Code.

13. Chapter 12, Energy Systems, Section 1205.2, Solar Photovoltaic Power Systems,
1205.2 Access and pathways, add:

Exception:
Structures built to the International Building Code and fully sprinklered with a NFPA 13
system.

14. CHAPTER 23, Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages, SECTION 2301, General.
Add subsections:

2301.7 Emergency Spill Containment. Each automotive motor fuel-dispensing
facility, marine motor fuel-dispensing facility, and fleet vehicle motor fuel-dispensing
facility shall maintain not less than one spill kit within 100 feet of dispensing
equipment and shall be immediately available for Fire Department use.

The type and size of spill kit shall be determined by the Fire Code Official and shall be
based upon the product and potential spill size. The person in control of the facility
shall be responsible to ensure kit supplies are replaced immediately after use.

2301.8 Disposal of Spilled Product. The person in control of the facility shall be
responsible for proper disposal of all spilled materials and spill mitigation products.
Spilled materials shall be immediately removed from the facility and shall be
transported to the appropri9ate hazardous waste facility. If immediate removal is
not possible, the spilled material and containment products shall be stored in a
manner approved by the Fire Code Official.

15. CHAPTER 56, Explosives and Fireworks, SECTION 5601, General SUBSECTION 5601.1.3,
Fireworks.

Strike Exception 4.

16. Chapter 61, Liquefied Petroleum Gases, Section 6104, Location, add:
6104.5 LP-Gas containers having a water capacity of 125 gallons or more, shall be
defined as a utility and be buried underground.

SECTION Il ~ THE FIRE PROTECITON RESOLUTION FOR NEW SUBDIVISIONS

SECTION 1.1: TITLE. This Resclution shall be known as the Teton County Fire Protection
Resolution For New Subdivisions, 2021 Edition as promulgated by Jackson Hole Fire/EMS.

SECTION 1.2: AUTHORITY. The Teton County Fire Protection Resolution For New Subdivisions is
authorized by Sections 18-5-201 and 18-5-301, Wyoming Statutes, 1977, as amended. The provisions
listed herein are based upon the International Fire Code and the International Wildland-Urban Interface
Code as adopted by Teton County, and other nationally recognized fire protection standards, such as




those standards promulgated by the National Fire Protection Association.

SECTION 1.3: PURPQSE. It is the purpose of this Resolution that, through the application of the
County's authority to review and approve residential and commercial subdivisions and planned unit
developments, adequate fire protection measures be required in all such developments in order to
protect the public health, safety and welfare. This purpose shall be achieved through the
implementation of the fire protection provisions of this Resclution in the form of fire department
access design; fire lane design; adequate year round water supply; sprinkler provisions; plan review
submittal; and fire resistive roof coverings and building materials for all residential subdivisions, all
commercial subdivisions, and all residential subdivisions or planned unit developments with
commercial areas. It is further the purpose of this Resolution that all provisions herein be subject to
Fire Department review and approval prior to installation.

SECTION 1.4: JURISDICTION. The territorial jurisdiction of the Fire Protection Resolution For New
Subdivisions shall include all of the non-incorporated non-federal lands within Teton County,
Wyoming. All subdivisions of land in Teton County and all planned unit developments shall comply
with the fire protection requirements set forth in this Resolution.

SECTION 1.5: APPLICABILITY. For the purpose of this Resolution, the term "subdivision" shall be
defined as any division of a plat, tract, parcel or lot of land into two (2) or more parts by means of
platting in accordance with the procedures and standards of Article VI, Platting and Land Records, Teton
County Land Development Regulations. For the purpose of administering the provisions of this
Resolution, if the subdivision is to be developed in two or more phases, the number of lots shall be the
total number of lots in all phases.

SECTION 1.6 SUBDIVISION APPROVAL CONDITIONED ON COMPLIANCE. No subdivision or Planned

Unit Development Permits shall be issued to any applicant unless they comply with the Fire
Protection Requirements of Chapter If of this Resolution.

SECTION 2.1: FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS DESIGN. The provisions of this section shall constitute

design requirements for driveways, roads, fire lanes, or any other means of providing fire apparatus
access from a fire station to a structure, or portion thereof. Alternate methods may be considered
by the Fire Department where allowed by the International Fire Code, the International Wildland
Urban Interface Code, or other nationally recognized standards.

3.1.1 Surface: The surface shall be an ali-weather type capable of supporting
the imposed loads of fire apparatus.

2.1.2 Turn Radius: The minimum turn radius shall be 50 feet on center line.
2.1.3 Vertical Clearance: The unobstructed height shall be not less than 13 feet 6 inches.

2.1.4 Grade: Where sustained grades exceed 10%, special fire protection may be
required as listed below. For the purpose of this section, a sustained grade
of 10% may include sections not to exceed 15% for not more than 200 feet,
provided those sections in excess of 10% are not on curves with radii of less
than 100 feet. This section shall not apply to access to agricultural buildings
or detached garages with no living space.



2.1.5

2.1.6

2,1.4.1 Protection of all occupancies by an automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with the International Fire Code, Chapter 9,
Section 903, 2021 Edition.

2.1.4.2 Other forms of protection,—given sufficient documentation - is
presented to substantiate an equivalent level of protection is
proposed and is approved.

Bridge Design: Bridges shall be engineered to support the imposed loads of the largest
fire apparatus which may use it, and shall meet the minimum design requirements of
the AASHTO Standard Specification for Highway Bridges, Standard H-15. Bridges shall
be posted/signed to indicate weight limit.

Bridge Width: The minimum drive surface of a bridge shall be not less than 14 feet.

2.1.7 Security Gates: The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access shall be

2.1.8

219

approved by the Fire Department. Where security gates are installed, they shall have
an approved means of emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency
operation shall be maintained operational at all times.

Road Design: Fire apparatus access roads serving more than two {2)
dwelling units shall be designed to the following additional requirements:

2.1.8.1 Road Width: The minimum road width for fire apparatus access
roads shall be 20 feet.

2.1.8.2 Dead Ends: Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet in
length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire
apparatus. Turnarounds may consist of Cul-de-Sacs with a minimum
diameter of 96 feet, Hammerhead Tee, Wye, or Dog Leg each with legs not
less than 60 feet measured to center line. The width of legs shall be not less
than 20 feet.

2.1.8.3 Gated Communities: The Fire Department may require additional fire
pratection in accordance with 2.1.5.1 - 2.1.5.4 of this section where all
structures within a subdivision are accessed through security gates.

2.1.8.4 Additional Access: The Fire Department may require more than one fire
apparatus access road where the potential for impairment of a single
road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climatic conditions or
other factors could limit access.

Driveway Design: A driveway is a fire apparatus access serving two (2) or fewer
dwelling units. Driveways shall be provided when any portion of an exterior wall of the
first story of a building is located more than 150 feet from a fire apparatus access road.
Driveways shall meet the following additional requirements:



2.1.9.4

2.1.9.5

2.1.10

221

2.19.1 Driveway Width: The minimum width of drive surface of a private drive shall
be not less than 12 feet. A clear width of not less than 16 feet shall remain
free of all obstructions, including vegetation in excess of 12 inches in height.

2.1.9.2 Turnarounds: Driveways shall include turnarounds where fire apparatus
access extends ionger than 150 feet without an approved fire apparatus
turnaround. Turnarounds may consist of cul-de-sacs with a minimum
diameter of 90 feet, Hammerhead Tee, Wye, or Dog Leg each with legs not
less than 40 feet measured to center line. The width of legs shall be not less
than 12 feet.

2.1.9.3 Turnouts: Driveways in excess of 200 feet in length, and less than 20 feet in
width shall be provided with turnouts in addition to turnarounds. Driveway
turnouts shall be an all-weather surface at least 10 feet wide and 30 feet
long. Turnout locations shall be approved by the Fire Department.

Bridges: Bridges shall be engineered to support the imposed loads of the largest fire
apparatus which may use it, and shall meet the minimum design requirements of the
AASHTO Standard Specification for Highway Bridges, Standard H-15. Bridges shall be
posted/signed to indicate weight limit.

Bridge Width: The minimum drive surface of a bridge shall be not less than 14 feet.

Fire Lane Design: A fire lane is a road or other passageway developed to allow the
passage of fire apparatus. A fire lane is not necessarily intended for vehicular traffic
other than fire apparatus. Fire lanes may be required in close proximity to structures
where access may be difficult due to traffic congestion, size of the building, proximity of
other structures, etc. Fire lanes required by the Fire Department shall meet the
following additional requirements:

2.1.10.1 Width: Fire lanes shall be not less than 20 feet in width.

2.1.10.2 Signage: Fire lanes shall be signed with approved signs that prohibit parking
within the required width of the lane.

2.1.10.3 Distance to Structure; The minimum distance from the closest edge of the
fire lane to the structure shall be approved by the fire department based on
the structure's square footage, height, and proximity to exposures.

SECTION 2.2; FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES. A year round water source for firefighting

purposes shall be provided for subdivisions. All systems shall be subject to Fire Department review
and approval prior to installation and shall meet required Department of Environmental Quality
standards.

Subdivisions with 3 to 10 Residential Lots:



2.2.1.1

Subdivisions with 3 to 10 residential lots, where average densities are 1 unit
to 3 or more acres, shall provide a water source in the form of:

- acentral main system with hydrants; OR

- one fire well with pump, hydrant, and reliable power source; OR

- storage tank with hydrant; OR

- one dry hydrant with cistern type storage (provided the water
table is capable of year round flow); OR

- other approved type suitable for year round use.

2.2.2 Subdivisions with 11 to 29 Residential Lots:

2.2.2.1

2.2.2.2

Subdivisions with 11 to 29 residential iots, where average densities are 1 unit
to 3 or more acres, shall provide a water source in the form of;

- acentral main system with hydrants; OR

- up to two fire wells with pump, hydrant, and reliable power source; OR

- storage tank(s) with hydrants; OR

- dry hydrants with cistern type storage (provided the water table is
capable of year round flow ); OR

- other approved type suitable for year round use.

Subdivisions with 11 to 29 residential lots, where average densities are 1 unit
to less than 3 acres, or where clustering is allowed, shall provide a water
source in the form of:

- acentral main system with hydrants; OR
- up to two fire wells with pump, hydrant, and reliable power source.

2.2.3 Subdivisions with 30 or more Residential Lots:

2.23.1

Subdivisions with 30 or more residential lots, where average densities are 1
unit to 3 acres or more, shall provide a water source in the form of:

- acentral main system with hydrants; OR

- fire wells with pumps, hydrants and reliable power source; OR

- storage tanks with hydrants; OR

- dry hydrants with cistern type storage (provided the water table is
capable of year round flow); OR

- other approved type suitable for year round use.

Where fire wells, storage tanks, or dry hydrants are used, a minimum of two
such sources shall be provided for the first 30 lots and one additional source
for each additional 15 lots, or fraction thereof.



2.24

2.2.5

2.2.6

2.2.3.2 Subdivisions with 30 or more residential lots, where average densities

are 1 unit to less than 3 acres, or where clustering of units is allowed,
shall provide a water source in the form of:

- acentral system with hydrants.

Commercial Subdivisions or Residential Subdivisions with Commercial Areas:
Commercial subdivisions or residential subdivisions with commercial areas shall provide
a fire fighting water supply based upon the type of businesses present, type of
construction, size of the buildings, proximity to exposures, fire flow requirements,
access, etc. Each system will be reviewed to the specific hazard and may necessitate
upgrading existing systems to provide adequate supply when changes of use occur.

Special Provisions: In all residential subdivisions, except those with commercial areas,
regardless of densities, the water source requirements may be reduced provided all
structures within the subdivision are protected by an approved automatic sprinkler
system. When water source requirements are reduced by use of sprinkler provisions,
the minimum number and type of sources shall be determined based upon road
system design, topography, exposure protection requirements, densities, travel
distance to established water sources, etc., and shall be subject to Fire Department
approval. The water source requirements shall not be reduced to less than 500 gallons
per minute in all circumstances.

System Designs: All required water supply systems shall be subject to Fire
Department approval and shall meet the design requirements of nationally recognized
standards and shall be installed to meet said standards with the following as minimum
requirements:

2.2.6.1 Central Mains with Hydrants:

2.2,6.1.1 A central hydrant system shall be capable of providing a minimum of
1000 gallons per minute for not less than 2 hours at a residual
pressure of 20 psi. Systems may provide 500 gallons per minute for
not less than two hours at a residual pressure of 20 psi when
installed in subdivisions where all residential occupancies are
protected by approved automatic residential sprinkler systems.

2.2.6.1.2 System mains shall be not less than 6 inch for looped lines, 8 inch
for dead end lines, subject to engineered hydraulic analysis.
Hydrants shall be serviced by a branch line not less than 6 inches
in diameter with a gate valve located on the branch line. Main
size may be down-sized accordingly to system demand when all
residential occupancies are protected by approved automatic
residential sprinkler systems.

2.2.6.1.3 Hydrants shall be dry barrel type with two 2 1/2 inch outlets and
one 4 1/2 inch outlet, all with National Standard Thread.



2.2.6.2

2.2.6.3

2.2.6.4

22,7

2.2.6.1.4 Hydrants shall be located adjacent to roadways, preferably on
corners, with the 41/2 inch outlet facing the road. Hydrants may
be placed not greater than 10 feet for the edge of the roadway.
Hydrants shall be spaced not more than 500 feet apart in
subdivisions with densities of 1 unit on less than 3 acres and 1000
feet apart in subdivision with densities of 1 unit on 3 or more
acres.

Fire Wells: Fire wells shall be capable of supplying a minimum of 500 gpm for
not less than 2 hours at a residual pressure of not less than 20 psi. Fire
pumps shall be automatic on demand and shall be provided with a reliable
power source, which may include utility power, on-site emergency
generator, engine driven pumps, or other approved system. One hydrant
shall be provided with a minimum of two 2 1/2 inch male outlets with
national standard thread.

Storage Tank with Hydrant: Storage tanks shall be sized to provide the
minimum required fire flow for not less than 2 hours. Tanks may be
underground, surface or elevated where allowed, and may consist of one or
multiple tanks. One hydrant shall be provided with a minimum of one 4 1/2
inch NST male thread outlet for underground tanks or two 2 1/2 inch outlets
for surface or elevated tanks, each with national standard thread.

Dry Hydrant with Cistern Type Storage: Dry hydrants with cistern type
storage shall be designed specifically to the aquifer in which it will be used,
but will be designed to flow a minimum of 500 gpm for not less than 2
hours. One hydrant shall be provided with a minimum of one 4 1/2 inch
NST male thread outlet with national standard thread.

Responsibility to Provide Binding Documentation: It shall be the responsibility
of the developer to provide adequate water supply, and system design
information to aliow the fire department to review and approve any system
design. When down-grading of the water supply system by use of sprinkler
systems throughout the subdivision is requested by the developer, adequate
documentation shall be provided by the developer to ensure minimum
requirements will be met.

2.2.8 Open water ponds. Open water ponds are not permitted for fire department
water supply.

SECTION 2.3 WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE. Subdivisions located in the wildland-urban interface
may be at risk of a devastating wildfire. Those subdivisions approved within the wildland-urban
interface shall comply with the International Wildiand-Urban Interfoce Code, 2021 Edition, using
Appendix C for determining property hazard ratings, as adopted.



Section 2.4 THE INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE {IWUIC), including Appendices,
2021 Edition, as promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., with the following amendments:

1. GENERAL: Substitute the National Electrical Code for all reference to the ICC Electrical Code
throughout the IWUIC.

Section 2.5, CHAPTER 1, Scope and Administration, SECTION 101, Scope and General Requirements,
SUBSECTION 101.5, Additions or alterations. Add exception:

Exception: Additions or alterations of not more than 500 square feet to existing
structures shall not be required to conform to that required for a new building or
structure.

Section 2.6, CHAPTER 4, Wildland-Urban Interface Area Requirements, SECTION 403, Access,
SUBSECTION 403.2.3 Service limitations. Amend to read:

A driveway shall serve not more than two dwelling units.

Section 2.7, CHAPTER 5, IGNITION-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIAL, SECTION 503, add:

503.3 Wood Shake Shingles. The use of all types of wood shake shingles is prohibited
within the mapped wildland urban interface area.

Section 2.8, CHAPTER 5, IGNITION-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL, SECTION 504.10, add,
504.10.1 Vent locations, Add exception:

Exception: Cold Roofs constructed above structural framing and insulation shall be
allowed to have horizontal ventilation located in soffits, in eave overhangs, between
rafters at eaves, or in other overhang areas, Ventilation shall be allowed when the
structural sheathing is protected by noncombustible materials used for one hour fire
resistive construction. Such ventilation shall be covered with noncombustible,
corrosion-resistant mesh with opening not to exceed % inch (6.4 mm). A Cold Roof is a
roof assembly constructed with a ventilated cavity above the insulated roof provided to
equalize exterior and interior temperatures through the process of air movement.

Section 2.9, CHAPTER 6, Fire Protection Requirements, SECTION 606, Liquefied Petroleum Gas
Installations. Add subsection:

606.3 Underground installation. LP-gas containers shall be installed underground
within the wildland-urban interface.

2. APPENDIX C, Fire Hazard Severity Form. Amend to read:

As attached in APPENDIX C, Area Fire Hazard Severity Form, as adopted.



2ECTION 2,4: ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS

24.1

Enforcement: The Fire Chief of Jackson Hole Fire/EMS, also referred to as the Fire
Code Official, shall be responsible for the interpretation and enforcement of the
provisions of this resolution, pursuant to the authority vested in him by the most
recently adopted edition of the International Fire Code.

In carrying out these responsibilities, the Fire Chief shall review all applications for
proposed residential and commercial subdivisions and planned unit developments,
whether referred by the Administrator of Planning or the permit applicants, and shall
submit a written report to the Administrator of Planning setting forth the
requirements of this resolution that must be met by the applicant in order to receive
Fire Department approval. All such fire protection requirements will be incorporated
into the Planning staff review of each application and shall be stated as required
conditions that the applicant must meet. Upon approval by the Board of County
Commissioners of the final plat of a subdivision or the final master plan of a planned
unit development, the conditions of such approval that relate to fire protection shall
be enforced by the Fire Chief of the Jackson Hole Fire/EMS.



